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BID NAME:

Bid Item

TOTAL # OF BIDS:

3

ONE WAY WITH LEFT ARROW 18" x 24"  No Bid  $                 5.74  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $                 5.40 
ONE WAY WITH RIGHT ARROW 18" x 24"  No Bid  $                 5.74  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $                 5.40 

LARGE DOUBLE ARROW 48" x 24"  No Bid  $               15.05  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $               14.40 
LARGE SINGLE ARROW 48" x 24"  No Bid  $               15.05  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $               14.40 

RIGHT SIDE BRIDGE END MKR 12" x 36"  No Bid  $                 5.90  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $                 5.40 
LEFT SIDE BRIDGE END MKR 12" x 36"  No Bid  $                 5.90  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $                 5.40 

NO PARKING 12" x 18"  No Bid  $                 3.17  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $                 2.70 
ALL WAY 18" x 6"  No Bid  $                 2.03  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $                 1.35 

ONE LANE BRIDGE 30" x 30"  No Bid  $               11.53  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $               11.25 
RIGHT CURVE SYMBOL 30" x 30"  No Bid  $               11.53  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $               11.25 

 $               11.53  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $               11.25 
LEFT CURVE SYMBOL 30" x 30"  No Bid  $               11.53  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $               11.25 
SLIPPERY WHEN WET SYMBOL 30" x 30"  No Bid 

 No Bid  No Bid  $                 2.70 
SLOW CHILDREN AT PLAY 18" x 24"  No Bid  $                 5.74  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $                 5.40 

NO DUMPING 12" x 18"  No Bid  $                 3.17  No Bid  No Bid 

 No Bid  No Bid  $                 9.00 
DEAD END 30" x 30"  No Bid  $               11.53  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $               11.25 

SPEED LIMIT 55 MPH 24" x 30"  No Bid  $                 9.32  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid  $                 9.00 

 No Bid  No Bid  $                 9.00 

Group 1 Sub-Total                  
(Sign Faces) No Bid  $             200.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $             191.25 

SPEED LIMIT 35 MPH 24" x 30"  No Bid  $                 9.32  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $                 9.00 
SPEED LIMIT 45 MPH 24" x 30"  No Bid 

BID TABULATION FORM
2:00 P.M.

 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $               16.20 
 No Bid  $                 9.32  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $                 9.00 

IBERIA PARISH GOVERNMENT 12/29/2008Courthouse Building, Suite 400                                                              
300 Iberia Street • New Iberia, LA 70560-4543                           
(337)365-8246 • Fax (337)369-4490

 $               12.02 

BID OPENING DATE:

BID OPENING TIME:

 No Bid 

Hall Signs, Inc. Lyle Signs, Inc.

Vendor

Vulcan SignsCenterline Supply Interstate Sign Ways Lightle Enterprises of 
Ohio, LLC Newman Traffic Signs

 No Bid  No Bid  $               11.25 

Sign Materials

SPEED LIMIT 15 MPH 24" x 30"

 No Bid  No Bid STOP 30" x 30"

STOP AHEAD 36" X 36"  No Bid  $               16.80  No Bid 

SPEED LIMIT 25 MPH 24" x 30"  No Bid  $                 9.32  No Bid  No Bid 

 $                 9.32  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid 



Bid Item

                    

Hall Signs, Inc. Lyle Signs, Inc.

Vendor

Vulcan SignsCenterline Supply Interstate Sign Ways Lightle Enterprises of 
Ohio, LLC Newman Traffic Signs
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EXTRUDED BLADES 9" x 24" x .08"

EXTRUDED BLADES 9" x 30" x .08"

EXTRUDED BLADES 9" x 30" x .08"

OCTAGON 30" x 30" x .08"
OCTAGON 30" x 36" x .08"
RECTANGLE 24" x 30" x .08"

RECTANGLE 12" x 36" x .08"

RECTANGLE 18" x 24" x .08"

RECTANGLE 48" x 24" x .08"

RECTANGLE 12" x 18" x .08"

RECTANGLE 12" x 6" x .08"

RECTANGLE 18" x 6" x .08"

DIAMOND 30" x 30" x .08" No Bid  $               20.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $               12.58 

 $             219.38 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $             183.37 

Group 5 Sub-Total                  
(Flanged U-Channel Posts) No Bid  $               28.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $               20.64 

6" Green Flanged U Channel Post 1.12#/ft. No Bid  $                 8.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $                 6.26 
10" Green Flanged U Channel Post 2#/ft. No Bid  $               20.01 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $               14.38 

Group 4 Sub-Total                  
(Sign Letters) No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $               17.77 

5" white upper case letters No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $               10.85 
3 3/4" white lower case letter No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $                 6.92 

Group 3 Sub-Total                  
(Scotchlite Sheeting) No Bid  $             739.38 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $             672.37 

24" x 50 yd. roll of grn & white sheeting No Bid  $             520.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $             489.00 

Group 2 Sub-Total                  
(Sign Blanks) No Bid  $             170.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $             105.28 

9" x 50 yd. roll of grn & white sheeting No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid  $                 4.91 No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid  $               10.31 No Bid No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid  $               18.09 No Bid
No Bid  $               25.81 No Bid
No Bid  $               16.02 No Bid
No Bid  $                 9.62 No Bid
No Bid  $                 9.72 No Bid
No Bid  $               25.85 No Bid

No Bid  $               12.73 No Bid
No Bid  $               12.73 No Bid

No Bid No Bid  $               11.79 

No Bid No Bid  $                 6.45 

No Bid No Bid  $                 3.14 

No Bid No Bid  $                 5.08 

No Bid  $                 1.69 No Bid
No Bid  $                 2.47 No Bid

No Bid No Bid  $               17.26 
No Bid No Bid  $               10.13 

No Bid No Bid  $                 6.16 
No Bid No Bid  $               16.55 

No Bid No Bid  $                 1.59 
No Bid No Bid  $                 1.93 

No Bid No Bid  $                 6.31 
No Bid No Bid  $                 6.31 



Bid Item

                    

Hall Signs, Inc. Lyle Signs, Inc.

Vendor

Vulcan SignsCenterline Supply Interstate Sign Ways Lightle Enterprises of 
Ohio, LLC Newman Traffic Signs
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Group 7 Sub-Total                  
(Blade Holders) No Bid  $                 8.66 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $               11.16 

10 - 15 Tons No Bid  $                 5.74 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $                 5.40 

VSS-6UC Cap for U-Channel Posts No Bid  $                 3.69 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $                 4.70 
3 5/32" Ext. Blades 90 degree crosses min No Bid  $                 2.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $                 2.90 

3 5/32" Ext. Blades 2 3/8 od Round Cap No Bid  $                 2.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $                 3.56 

Group 6 Sub-Total                  
(Round Posts) No Bid  $               18.77 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $               16.45 

10' Round Galvanized Post 2 3/8" od 1.64#/ft No Bid  $               18.77 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $               16.45 

Group 8 Sub-Total                  
(Weight Limit Facing Signs) No Bid  $               28.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $               27.00 

25 - 40 Tons No Bid  $                 5.74 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $                 5.40 
20 - 40 Tons No Bid  $                 5.74 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $                 5.40 
20 - 35 Tons No Bid  $                 5.74 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $                 5.40 
15 - 25 Tons No Bid  $                 5.74 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $                 5.40 

3. FOR INTERNAL USE ONLY
DEPARTMENT 

APPROVAL
AWARD LETTER                    

DATE
REGRET LETTER                    

DATE

AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE

START DATE END DATE

AWARDED VENDOR

Vulcan Signs - All Groups, except 7         
Hall Signs - Group 7 ONLY

NAMES OF IBERIA PARISH GOVERNMENT                                                               
STAFF MEMBERS IN ATTENDANCE OF BID OPENING

Kimberly Segura, Finance Director
Michael Broussard, Purchasing Officer

1/8/2009                       
Terry Bourque                               
& Paul Vincent

1/9/2009 1/9/2009 1/15/2008 6/30/2008
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