BID NAME:

Road Materials

BID OPENING DATE:
12/29/2008

TOTAL # OF BIDS:
8

BID OPENING TIME:
2:00 P.M.

BID TABULATION FORM

Vendor

Lafayette

. Baldwin Coastal Culvert ; Diversified Fontenot's : Sea Shells, Southern Vermilion Shell § Acadiana Shell Angelle B &D
Bld Item Redi-Mix & Supply, Inc. (SRS Materials Construction W\}\?(\)/\:eka;er Inc. Aggregates & Limestone & Limestone | Concrete Group Materials
Fill Sand - Picked Up . . . . . . . .
1 (Per Ton) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | $ 14.00] NoBid |$ 10.00]$ 10.00] NoBid |$ 5.00
2 [P | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid [ NoBid [$ 1650/ NoBid [$ 1000|$ 1200] NoBid |$  9.00
3 | Miles to Parish Barn No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ? No Bid 5 3 No Bid 22.5

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid |$ 3050 NoBid | $ 20.00]%$ 2200 NoBid [$ 14.00

6 Bag Ready Mix
4 | Concrete - Delivered | $ 104.00] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
(Per Cubic Yard)
5 Bag Ready Mix

5 | Concrete - Delivered | $ 100.00] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
(Per Cubic Yard)

Read ed . $ 204.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

18" Corrugated Metal
6 Pipe - Delivered No Bid NoBid | $ 17.44] No Bid NoBid | $ 19.94] No Bid NoBid | $ 17.21] No Bid No Bid No Bid
(.05 Asphalt Coated)
24" Corrugated Metal
7 Pipe - Delivered No Bid NoBid | $ 22.89] No Bid NoBid | $ 26.34] No Bid NoBid | $ 26.85] No Bid No Bid No Bid
(.05 Asphalt Coated)
30" Corrugated Metal

8 Pipe - Delivered No Bid NoBid | $ 28.23] No Bid NoBid | $ 31.22| No Bid NoBid | $ 33.25| No Bid No Bid No Bid
(.05 Asphalt Coated)




36" Corrugated Metal
Pipe - Delivered
(.05 Asphalt Coated)

Baldwin
Redi-Mix

Coastal Culvert
& Supply, Inc.

Coburn's

Diversified
Materials

Fontenot's
Construction

Lafayette
Winwater
Works

Sea Shells,

Inc.

Southern
Aggregates

Vermilion Shell
& Limestone

Acadiana Shell
& Limestone

Angelle
Concrete Group

B&D
Materials

No Bid

No Bid

$ 33.75

No Bid

No Bid

$ 45.00

No Bid

No Bid

$ 39.66

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

10

42" Corrugated Metal
Pipe - Delivered
(.05 Asphalt Coated)

No Bid

No Bid

$ 39.18

No Bid

No Bid

$ 5244

No Bid

No Bid

$ 42.07

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

11

48" Corrugated Metal
Pipe - Delivered
(.05 Asphalt Coated)

No Bid

No Bid

$ 4461

No Bid

No Bid

$ 57.44

No Bid

No Bid

$ 53.20

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

12

54" Corrugated Metal
Pipe - Delivered
(.05 Asphalt Coated)

No Bid

No Bid

$ 61.49

No Bid

No Bid

$ 64.94

No Bid

No Bid

$ 5961

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

13

60" Corrugated Metal
Pipe - Delivered
(.05 Asphalt Coated)

No Bid

No Bid

$ 68.28

No Bid

No Bid

$ 115.85

No Bid

No Bid

$ 7871

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

14

66" Corrugated Metal
Pipe - Delivered
(.05 Asphalt Coated)

No Bid

No Bid

$ 75.16

No Bid

No Bid

$ 133.54

No Bid

No Bid

$ 92.82

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

15

72" Corrugated Metal
Pipe - Delivered
(.05 Asphalt Coated)

No Bid

No Bid

$ 102.53

No Bid

No Bid

$ 140.37

No Bid

No Bid

$ 101.67

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 493.56

No Bid

No Bid

$ 687.08

No Bid

No Bid

$ 545.05

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

16

22"x13" Metal Arched
Pipe - Delivered
(.05 Asphalt Coated)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 20.85

No Bid

No Bid

$ 18.27

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

17

25"x16" Metal Arched
Pipe - Delivered
(.05 Asphalt Coated)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 24.02

No Bid

No Bid

$ 20.72

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

18

29"x18" Metal Arched
Pipe - Delivered
(.05 Asphalt Coated)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 28.05

No Bid

No Bid

$ 2861

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

19

36"x22" Metal Arched
Pipe - Delivered
(.05 Asphalt Coated)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 35.37

No Bid

No Bid

$ 3545

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

20

43"x27" Metal Arched
Pipe - Delivered
(.05 Asphalt Coated)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 46.22

No Bid

No Bid

$ 4228

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid




- A Baldwin Coastal Culvert Coburn' Diversified Fontenot's \I/_Va_lfayette Sea Shells, Southern Vermilion Shell | Acadiana Shell Angelle B&D
D10 Redi-Mix & Supply, Inc. oburn's Materials Construction \;\;](;A;iser Inc. Aggregates & Limestone & Limestone | Concrete Group Materials
50"x31" Metal Arched
21 Pipe - Delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 51.28] No Bid NoBid | $ 49.12] No Bid No Bid No Bid
(.05 Asphalt Coated)
58"x36" Metal Arched
22 Pipe - Delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 80.49] No Bid NoBid | $ 68.55| No Bid No Bid No Bid
(.05 Asphalt Coated)
65"x40" Metal Arched
23 Pipe - Delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 84.15] No Bid NoBid | $ 76.65| No Bid No Bid No Bid
(.05 Asphalt Coated)
72"x44" Metal Arched
24 Pipe - Delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 89.63] No Bid NoBid | $ 83.69] No Bid No Bid No Bid
(.05 Asphalt Coated)
80"x49" Metal Arched
25 Pipe - Delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 108.54| No Bid NoBid | $ 98.76] No Bid No Bid No Bid
(.05 Asphalt Coated)
84"x56" Metal Arched
26 Pipe - Delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 112.80| No Bid NoBid | $ 108.18] No Bid No Bid No Bid
(.05 Asphalt Coated)
ongvbiaielll No Bid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid |$ 681.40| NoBid | NoBid |$ 630.28| NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
12" Reinforced
27 Concrete Pipe - No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | $ 15.05] No Bid No Bid No Bid
Delivered
15" Reinforced
28 Concrete Pipe - No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | $ 15.45| No Bid No Bid No Bid
Delivered
18" Reinforced
29 Concrete Pipe - No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | $ 18.95| No Bid No Bid No Bid
Delivered
24" Reinforced
30 Concrete Pipe - No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | $ 28.55| No Bid No Bid No Bid
Delivered
30" Reinforced
31 Concrete Pipe - No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | $ 40.45| No Bid No Bid No Bid
Delivered
36" Reinforced
32 Concrete Pipe - No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | $ 57.10] No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivered




33

42" Reinforced
Concrete Pipe -
Delivered

Baldwin
Redi-Mix

Coastal Culvert
& Supply, Inc.

Coburn's

Diversified
Materials

Fontenot's
Construction

Lafayette
Winwater
Works

Sea Shells,

Inc.

Southern
Aggregates

Vermilion Shell
& Limestone

Acadiana Shell
& Limestone

Angelle
Concrete Group

B&D
Materials

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 69.50

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

34

48" Reinforced
Concrete Pipe -
Delivered

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 87.90

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

35

54" Reinforced
Concrete Pipe -
Delivered

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 130.20

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

36

60" Reinforced
Concrete Pipe -
Delivered

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 155.80

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

37

72" Reinforced
Concrete Pipe -
Delivered

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 182.60

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

38

12" Non-Reinforced
Concrete Pipe -
Delivered

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

39

15" Non-Reinforced
Concrete Pipe -
Delivered

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

40

18" Non-Reinforced
Concrete Pipe -
Delivered

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

41

24" Non-Reinforced
Concrete Pipe -
Delivered

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

42

30" Non-Reinforced
Concrete Pipe -
Delivered

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

43

36" Non-Reinforced
Concrete Pipe -
Delivered

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

N/A

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

44

4" Corrugated
Polyethylene Pipe -
Delivered

No Bid

No Bid

$ 0.98

No Bid

No Bid

$ 0.97

No Bid

No Bid

$ 0.83

$ 0.91

No Bid

No Bid




45

Bid Item

Baldwin
Redi-Mix

Coastal Culvert
& Supply, Inc.

Coburn's

Diversified
Materials

Fontenot's
Construction

Lafayette
Winwater
Works

Vendor

Sea Shells,
Inc.

Southern
Aggregates

Vermilion Shell
& Limestone

Acadiana Shell
& Limestone

Angelle
Concrete Group

B&D
Materials

6" Corrugated
Polyethylene Pipe -
Delivered

No Bid

No Bid

$ 2.28

No Bid

No Bid

2.34

No Bid

No Bid

$

2.09

$

2.19

No Bid

No Bid

46

8" Corrugated
Polyethylene Pipe -
Delivered

No Bid

No Bid

$ 3.81

No Bid

No Bid

3.91

No Bid

No Bid

3.49

3.69

No Bid

No Bid

47

10" Corrugated
Polyethylene Pipe -
Delivered

No Bid

No Bid

$ 5.43

No Bid

No Bid

5.40

No Bid

No Bid

4.98

5.25

No Bid

No Bid

48

12" Corrugated
Polyethylene Pipe -
Delivered

No Bid

No Bid

$ 5.86

No Bid

No Bid

5.82

No Bid

No Bid

5.67

5.63

No Bid

No Bid

49

15" Corrugated
Polyethylene Pipe -
Delivered

No Bid

No Bid

$ 7.89

No Bid

No Bid

7.85

No Bid

No Bid

7.24

7.59

No Bid

No Bid

50

18" Corrugated
Polyethylene Pipe -
Delivered

No Bid

No Bid

$ 11.10

No Bid

No Bid

11.04

No Bid

No Bid

10.21

10.68

No Bid

No Bid

51

24" Corrugated
Polyethylene Pipe -
Delivered

No Bid

No Bid

$ 17.37

No Bid

No Bid

17.28

No Bid

No Bid

15.98

16.71

No Bid

No Bid

52

30" Corrugated
Polyethylene Pipe -
Delivered

No Bid

No Bid

$ 27.89

No Bid

No Bid

27.78

No Bid

No Bid

25.71

26.87

No Bid

No Bid

53

36" Corrugated
Polyethylene Pipe -
Delivered

No Bid

No Bid

$ 34.22

No Bid

No Bid

34.04

No Bid

No Bid

31.50

32.93

No Bid

No Bid

54

42" Corrugated
Polyethylene Pipe -
Delivered

No Bid

No Bid

$ 47.67

No Bid

No Bid

47.42

No Bid

No Bid

46.05

45.86

No Bid

No Bid

55

48" Corrugated
Polyethylene Pipe -
Delivered

No Bid

No Bid

$ 57.16

No Bid

No Bid

56.85

No Bid

No Bid

52.62

54.98

No Bid

No Bid

56

4" Coupling Band for
Polyethylene Pipe -
Delivered

No Bid

No Bid

$ 1.32

No Bid

No Bid

3.05

No Bid

No Bid

1.22

1.25

No Bid

No Bid

57

6" Coupling Band for
Polyethylene Pipe -
Delivered

No Bid

No Bid

$ 3.43

No Bid

No Bid

3.05

No Bid

No Bid

2.85

2.94

No Bid

No Bid




58

Bid Item

8" Coupling Band for
Polyethylene Pipe -
Delivered

Baldwin
Redi-Mix

Coastal Culvert
& Supply, Inc.

Coburn's

Diversified
Materials

Fontenot's
Construction

Lafayette
Winwater
Works

Vendor

Sea Shells,

Inc.

Southern
Aggregates

Vermilion Shell
& Limestone

Acadiana Shell
& Limestone

Angelle
Concrete Group

B&D
Materials

No Bid

No Bid

$ 4.69

No Bid

No Bid

4.15

No Bid

No Bid

$ 3.90

$ 3.80

No Bid

No Bid

59

10" Coupling Band for
Polyethylene Pipe -
Delivered

No Bid

No Bid

$ 6.46

No Bid

No Bid

5.70

No Bid

No Bid

$ 5.37

$ 5.54

No Bid

No Bid

60

12" Coupling Band for
Polyethylene Pipe -
Delivered

No Bid

No Bid

$ 7.29

No Bid

No Bid

6.45

No Bid

No Bid

$ 6.07

$ 6.25

No Bid

No Bid

61

15" Coupling Band for
Polyethylene Pipe -
Delivered

No Bid

No Bid

$ 1213

No Bid

No Bid

10.70

No Bid

No Bid

$ 10.10

$ 1041

No Bid

No Bid

62

18" Coupling Band for
Polyethylene Pipe -
Delivered

No Bid

No Bid

$ 20.66

No Bid

No Bid

18.25

No Bid

No Bid

$ 17.22

$ 17.73

No Bid

No Bid

63

24" Coupling Band for
Polyethylene Pipe -
Delivered

No Bid

No Bid

$ 29.15

No Bid

No Bid

25.70

No Bid

No Bid

$ 2429

$ 25.02

No Bid

No Bid

64

30" Coupling Band for
Polyethylene Pipe -
Delivered

No Bid

No Bid

$ 64.94

No Bid

No Bid

59.80

No Bid

No Bid

$ 56.47

$ 58.16

No Bid

No Bid

65

36" Coupling Band for
Polyethylene Pipe -
Delivered

No Bid

No Bid

$ 90.36

No Bid

No Bid

83.20

No Bid

No Bid

$ 7856

$ 80.93

No Bid

No Bid

66

42" Coupling Band for
Polyethylene Pipe -
Delivered

No Bid

No Bid

$ 132.25

No Bid

No Bid

121.80

No Bid

No Bid

$ 115.00

$ 118.30

No Bid

No Bid

67

48" Coupling Band for
Polyethylene Pipe -
Delivered

ed Poly Pipe &
g

No Bid

No Bid

$ 155.25

No Bid

No Bid

142.95

No Bid

No Bid

$ 135.00

$ 139.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 749.59

No Bid

No Bid

705.50

No Bid

No Bid

$ 662.42

$ 682.62

No Bid

No Bid

68

No. 8 Limestone
(Regular) - Picked Up
(Per Ton)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 30.25

No Bid

No Bid

$

36.00

No Bid

$ 3276

$ 3040

No Bid

No Bid

69

No. 8 Limestone
(Regular) - Delivered
(Per Ton)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 34.50

No Bid

No Bid

$

38.50

No Bid

$ 36.60

$ 3340

No Bid

No Bid




- A Baldwin Coastal Culvert Cob , Diversified Fontenot's \I/_Va_lfayette Sea Shells, Southern Vermilion Shell | Acadiana Shell Angelle B &D
=110 Redi-Mix & Supply, Inc. oburn's Materials Construction \;\;](;A;iser Inc. Aggregates & Limestone & Limestone | Concrete Group Materials
No. 8 Limestone
70 ] (Clean) - Picked Up No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 37.00 No Bid $ 32761 $ 30.40] No Bid No Bid
(Per Ton)
No. 8 Limestone
71| (Clean) - Delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | $ 3850 NoBid |$ 37.60}$ 33.40| No Bid No Bid
(Per Ton)
No. 78 Limestone
72 ] (Clean) - Picked Up No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 37.00 No Bid $ 32.76]$ 31.40] No Bid No Bid
(Per Ton)
No. 78 Limestone
73| (Clean) - Delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | $ 3850 NoBid |$ 36.60f$ 34.70] No Bid No Bid
(Per Ton)
No. 57 Limestone
74 Picked Up No Bid No Bid NoBid | $ 29.25] No Bid NoBid | $ 32.00] NoBid | $ 32.76]% 30.40] No Bid No Bid
(Per Ton)
No. 57 Limestone
75 Delivered No Bid No Bid NoBid | $ 33.50| No Bid NoBid | $ 34.00] NoBid | $ 36.60]$% 33.40]| No Bid No Bid
(Per Ton)
No. 610 Limestone
76 Picked Up No Bid No Bid NoBid | $ 28.75] No Bid NoBid | $ 31.00] NoBid | $ 32.20]$%$ 29.90] NoBid No Bid
(Per Ton)
No. 610 Limestone
77 Delivered No Bid No Bid NoBid | $ 33.00] No Bid NoBid | $ 33.00] NoBid | $ 36.000$% 3290| No Bid No Bid
(Per Ton)
I No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid NoBid | $ 355.50] NoBid | $ 346.64| $ 320.30| No Bid No Bid
STAFF MEMBERS IN ATTENDANCE OF BID OPENING B & D Materials - Groupl Vermilion Shell - Groups 4, 5, 6
n . . Baldwin RediMix - Group2 Acadiana Shell - Group7, ltems 69-73, 75, 77 (WW’—-
K|mber|y Segura, Finance Director Coburn's - Group3 Diversified - Group7, Items 68, 74, 76

Michael Broussard, Purchasing Officer

FOR INTERNAL USE ONLY
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DEPARTMENT AWARD REGRET
APPROVAL LETTER DATE | LETTER DATE START DATE END DATE
1/8/2009
Terry IBourque & | 1/14/2009 | 1/14/2009 | 1/15/2009 | 6/30/2009
Paul Vincent
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