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BID TABULATION FORM

Parish Barn Supplies

2 2:00 P.M.

IBERIA PARISH GOVERNMENT 12/29/2008Courthouse Building, Suite 400                                                              
300 Iberia Street • New Iberia, LA 70560                          
(337)365-8246 • Fax (337)369-4490

BID NAME:

TOTAL # OF BIDS:

BID OPENING DATE:

BID OPENING TIME:

Voorhies 
Supply Co.Auto Zone Himel Motor 

Supply
LaSalle Oil & 

Gas Company

Vendor

Bid Item
1060 Napa Filter No Bid 3.29$                No Bid No BidNo Bid

Advanced Auto 
Supplies

No Bid
1068 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 3.19$                No Bid No Bid
1202 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 9.73$                No Bid No Bid

1061 Napa Filter No Bid 3.29$                No Bid No Bid

1204 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 14.89$              No Bid No Bid
1290 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 19.73$              No Bid No Bid
1344 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 4.50$                No Bid No Bid
1372 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 3.49$                No Bid No Bid
1453 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 5.03$                No Bid No Bid
1494 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 28.85$              No Bid No Bid
1515 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 3.08$                No Bid No Bid
1551 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 4.10$                No Bid No Bid
1553 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 4.00$                No Bid No Bid
1607 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 4.42$                No Bid No Bid
1616 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 36.78$              No Bid No Bid
1674 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 19.07$              No Bid No Bid
1712 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 7.03$                No Bid No Bid
1734 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 9.18$                No Bid No Bid

No Bid 22.90$              No Bid No Bid
1749 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 13.26$              No Bid No Bid
1748 Napa Filter No Bid

1754 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 7.04$                No Bid No Bid
1756 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 11.34$              No Bid No Bid
1768 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 5.28$                No Bid No Bid
1789 Napa Filter No Bid No BidNo Bid No Bid 5.34$                
1791 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 6.06$                No Bid No Bid
1792 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 11.52$              No Bid No Bid
1799 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 16.52$              No Bid No Bid
1806 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 5.48$                No Bid No Bid
1810 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 13.24$              No Bid No Bid
1817 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 30.25$              No Bid No Bid
1825 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 8.28$                No Bid No Bid
1832 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 8.93$                No Bid No Bid
1970 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 11.22$              No Bid No Bid
2941 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 44.46$              No Bid No Bid
3029 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 1.87$                No Bid No Bid
3033 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 2.66$                No Bid No Bid
3099 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 9.34$                No Bid No Bid
3107 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 3.03$                No Bid No Bid
3109 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 4.07$                No Bid No Bid
3116 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 13.08$              No Bid No Bid
3118 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 5.43$                No Bid No Bid
3122 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 4.32$                No Bid No Bid
3123 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 8.23$                No Bid No Bid
3125 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 5.99$                No Bid No Bid
3136 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 10.77$              No Bid No Bid



Voorhies 
Supply Co.Auto Zone Himel Motor 

Supply
LaSalle Oil & 

Gas Company

Vendor

Bid Item
                      

Advanced Auto 
Supplies

46

47

48

49

50

51

52

53

54

55

56

57

58

59

60

61

62

63

64

65

66

67

68

69

70

71

72

73

74

75

76

77

78

79

80

81

82

83

84

85

86

87

88

89

90

91

92

93

94

3166 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 3.49$                No Bid No Bid
3172 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 11.57$              No Bid No Bid
3201 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 2.47$                No Bid No Bid
3216 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 7.81$                No Bid No Bid
3219 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 5.78$                No Bid No Bid
3238 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 12.47$              No Bid No Bid
3239 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 4.86$                No Bid No Bid
3244 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 5.21$                No Bid No Bid
3281 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 7.52$                No Bid No Bid
3296 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 5.84$                No Bid No Bid
3336 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 6.89$                No Bid No Bid
3338 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 7.07$                No Bid No Bid
3341 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 5.45$                No Bid No Bid
3344 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 10.52$              No Bid No Bid
3352 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 4.49$                No Bid No Bid
3358 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 4.74$                No Bid No Bid
3360 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 3.15$                No Bid No Bid
3367 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 4.94$                No Bid No Bid
3368 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 4.40$                No Bid No Bid
3376 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 12.39$              No Bid No Bid
3399 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 6.95$                No Bid No Bid
3403 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 6.89$                No Bid No Bid
3405 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 8.47$                No Bid No Bid
3406 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 10.71$              No Bid No Bid
3415 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 8.47$                No Bid No Bid
3472 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 7.21$                No Bid No Bid
3511 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 3.24$                No Bid No Bid
3518 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 16.87$              No Bid No Bid
3528 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 7.01$                No Bid No Bid
3531 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 11.98$              No Bid No Bid
3548 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 12.36$              No Bid No Bid
3585 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 8.81$                No Bid No Bid
3633 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 15.92$              No Bid No Bid
3674 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 9.71$                No Bid No Bid
3680 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 10.44$              No Bid No Bid
3719 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 12.43$              No Bid No Bid
4006 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 4.50$                No Bid No Bid
4071 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 6.65$                No Bid No Bid
4072 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 9.26$                No Bid No Bid
7073 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 9.59$                No Bid No Bid
4429 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 11.97$              No Bid No Bid
7182 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 6.01$                No Bid No Bid
7197 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 15.50$              No Bid No Bid
7243 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 7.79$                No Bid No Bid
7314 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 12.46$              No Bid No Bid
7803 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 59.72$              No Bid No Bid

2033 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 25.27$              No Bid No Bid

Group 1 Sub-Total                  
(Oil & Fuel Filters) No Bid No Bid 905.54$            No Bid No Bid

2034 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 14.21$              No Bid No Bid
2208 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 24.35$              No Bid No Bid
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2209 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 18.76$              No Bid No Bid
2253 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 29.01$              No Bid No Bid
2254 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 19.26$              No Bid No Bid
2334 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 24.48$              No Bid No Bid
2336 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 26.29$              No Bid No Bid
2491 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 38.33$              No Bid No Bid
2518 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 16.23$              No Bid No Bid
2519 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 12.24$              No Bid No Bid
2520 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 35.58$              No Bid No Bid
2611 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 41.74$              No Bid No Bid
2635 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 28.10$              No Bid No Bid
2636 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 30.32$              No Bid No Bid
2651 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 21.66$              No Bid No Bid
2661 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 42.89$              No Bid No Bid
2665 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 15.46$              No Bid No Bid
2714 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 3.06$                No Bid No Bid
2868 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 22.52$              No Bid No Bid
2920 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 15.10$              No Bid No Bid
2941 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 44.46$              No Bid No Bid
6174 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 5.40$                No Bid No Bid
6407 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 28.91$              No Bid No Bid
6417 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 15.21$              No Bid No Bid
6418 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 10.13$              No Bid No Bid
6466 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 25.26$              No Bid No Bid
6467 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 15.69$              No Bid No Bid
6476 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 32.46$              No Bid No Bid
6477 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 23.97$              No Bid No Bid
6502 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 38.00$              No Bid No Bid
6507 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 47.57$              No Bid No Bid
6515 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 29.49$              No Bid No Bid
6516 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 17.49$              No Bid No Bid
6522 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 13.78$              No Bid No Bid
6556 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 43.65$              No Bid No Bid
6647 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 31.00$              No Bid No Bid
6648 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 9.35$                No Bid No Bid
6671 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 15.81$              No Bid No Bid
6761 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 32.19$              No Bid No Bid
6776 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 50.81$              No Bid No Bid
6777 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 38.22$              No Bid No Bid
6804 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 14.35$              No Bid No Bid
6870 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 37.03$              No Bid No Bid
6871 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 33.12$              No Bid No Bid
6937 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 37.27$              No Bid No Bid
7182 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 6.01$                No Bid No Bid
7197 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 15.50$              No Bid No Bid
7243 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 7.79$                No Bid No Bid
7314 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 12.46$              No Bid No Bid
7744 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 23.47$              No Bid No Bid
7803 Napa Filter No Bid No Bid 59.72$              No Bid No Bid

Group 2 Sub-Total                  
(Air Filters) No Bid No Bid 1,320.43$         No Bid No Bid
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1/8/2009 1/13/2009 1/13/2009 1/15/2009 6/30/2009

Aero Kroil 10oz. Cans (12/Case) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 96.00$            
Group 3 Sub-Total                  

(Miscellaneous) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 874.93$          

4.

5.

6.

NAMES OF IBERIA PARISH GOVERNMENT STAFF 
MEMBERS IN ATTENDANCE OF BID OPENING

Kimberly Segura, Finance Director

Michael Broussard, Purchasing Officer

3.

1.

2.

AWARDED VENDOR

DEPT. 
APPROVAL

AWARD 
LETTER 

DATE

REGRET 
LETTER 

DATE
END DATESTART 

DATE

FOR INTERNAL USE ONLY

Himel Motor Supply - Groups 1 & 2                       
Voorhies Supply Co. - Group 3

AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE

PB Blaster 11oz. Cans / Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 39.36$            
Open Gear Lube Grease 14oz. Cans / 

Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 168.48$          
Deep Woods Mosquito Spray 6oz. Cans / 

Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 168.00$          
Fast Orange Hand Cleaner 128 fl. Oz. 

3.78 L / Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 197.04$          
Orange Dot Cotton Gloves / pair No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.61$              

Starting Fluid 11oz. / Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 48.72$            

Brake Fluid 32oz. Cans / Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 156.72$          
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