BID NAME: BID OPENING DATE:

12/29/2008

IBERIA PARISH GOVERNMENT
Courthouse Building, Suite 400

300 Iberia Street « New lIberia, LA 70560-4543
(337)365-8246 * Fax (337)369-4490

Oils & Greases

TOTAL # OF BIDS:

3

BID OPENING TIME:

2:00 P.M.

BID TABULATION FORM

Vendor

Bid Item Lard OiI. Co. Himel Motor LaSalle Oil & .St. Martin United.FueIs & Miguez

of Acadiana Supply Gas Company | Oil & Gas, Inc. Lubricants Fuel, Inc.
1| Series 3 Oil 30Wt. /55 Gallon Drum | $ 468.72 No Bid No Bid $ 439.86 No Bid $ 515.00
2 | Hitemp Ultra Duty Grease 140z. 10/Case | $ 20.92 No Bid No Bid $ 19.98 No Bid $ 19.90
3 | Hydraulic Oil / 55 Gallon Drum | $ 446.72 No Bid No Bid $ 456.87 No Bid $ 424.00
4 | Transmission Oil / 55 Gallon Drum | $ 432.06 No Bid No Bid $ 339.21 No Bid $ 422.30
5 | Hi-Temp Grease /35 Gallon Pail | $ 78.48 No Bid No Bid $ 74.68 No Bid $ 58.00
6 | Mercron/Dexron Il /55 Gallon Drum | $ 432.06 No Bid No Bid $ 339.91 No Bid $ 422.30
7 | Multi-Purp Oil 15/40 per 55 Gal Drum | $ 435.72 No Bid No Bid $ 445,75 No Bid $ 412.50
8 | Multi-Purp Oil 10/30 per 55 Gal Drum | $ 425.94 No Bid No Bid $ 429.88 No Bid $ 364.10
9 | Multi-Purp Gear Lube 80W-140 / pail | $ 58.13 No Bid No Bid $ 489.98 No Bid $ 54.00
$ 2,798.75 No Bid No Bid $ 3,036.12 No Bid $ 2,692.10

NAMES OF IBERIA PARISH GOVERNMENT AWARDED VENDOR AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE

STAFF MEMBERS IN ATTENDANCE OF BID OPENING St. Martin - Bid Items 1, 4, & 6 M

Kimberly Segura, Finance Director Miguez Fuel - Bid ltems 2, 3,5, 7,8, &9

Michael Broussard, Purchasing Officer

FOR INTERNAL USE ONLY
DEPARTMENT AWARD LETTER REGRET LETTER

olalr|wNIE

APPROVAL DATE DATE START DATE END DATE
1/8/2009

Terry Bourque 1/12/2009 1/12/2009 1/15/2009 1/15/2009

& Paul Vincent
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