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10" x 15" Brown Clasp 
Envelopes (100/Box) No Bid No Bid  $               10.85  $               10.41 No Bid  $               13.70 

Group 2 Sub-Total                  
(Computer Paper) No Bid No Bid  $               59.95  $               52.84 No Bid  $               46.36 

Pitman Steno Books (per 
Pad) No Bid No Bid  $                 1.20  $                 1.28 No Bid  $                 1.90 

Wilson Jones Minute Paper 8 1/2" x 
14" (100 sheets / Pack) No Bid No Bid  $               60.49  No Bid No Bid  $               64.99 

Legal Pad 8 1/2" x 14" White 
Ruled (per Dozen) No Bid No Bid  $               11.95  $               11.10 No Bid  $               12.49 

No. 10 Plain White 
Envelopes (500/Box) No Bid No Bid  $                 8.25  $                 6.66 No Bid  $                 7.60 

9" x 12" Brown Clasp 
Envelopes (100/Box) No Bid No Bid  $                 6.49  $                 6.21 No Bid  $                 7.50 

No Bid  $               82.25  $             101.60 No Bid  $               84.45 

Computer Paper 14 7/8" x 8 1/2" 
Continuous(per Case) No Bid No Bid  $               59.95  $               52.84 No Bid  $               46.36 

BID TABULATION FORM

Office Supplies

3 2:00 P.M.

IBERIA PARISH GOVERNMENT 12/29/2008Courthouse Building, Suite 400                                                              
300 Iberia Street • New Iberia, LA 70560-4543                           
(337)365-8246 • Fax (337)369-4490

 No Bid 

BID NAME:

TOTAL # OF BIDS:

BID OPENING DATE:

BID OPENING TIME:

 No Bid 

Office Depot Staples Business 
Advantage

Vendor

 $               59.80  $               51.00 

 No Bid  $               34.90 

Bid Item
Copy Paper Letter 8 1/2" x 11" 

White (10 reams / Case)

Copy Paper Legal 8 1/2" x 14" 
White (10 reams / Case) No Bid  $               47.35 No Bid No Bid

Iberia Office 
Supply Office Mart Shamrock Office 

Supply, Inc.
Teche Office 
Supplies, Inc.

 $               41.80  $               33.45 

Group 1 Sub-Total                  
(Copy Paper) No Bid



      

Office Depot Staples Business 
Advantage

Vendor

                    

Bid Item
       

    

Iberia Office 
Supply Office Mart Shamrock Office 

Supply, Inc.
Teche Office 
Supplies, Inc.
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File Labels Self Adhesive All 
Colors (per Box) No Bid No Bid  $                 0.69  $                 2.10 No Bid  $                 2.18 

Wrapping Paper Brown 18" 
Wide (per Roll) No Bid No Bid  $               30.80  No Bid No Bid  $               32.99 

Wrapping Tape 1" Wide (per 
Roll) No Bid No Bid  $                 8.95  $                 9.80 No Bid  $                 8.49 

Tape Refills 3/4" Wide 1" 
Core (per Roll) No Bid No Bid  $                 0.79  $                 2.11 No Bid  $                 1.29 

Post-it Note Pads #655 (per 
Dozen) No Bid No Bid  $                 4.92  $               14.40 No Bid  $                 6.01 

Post-it Note Pads #654 (per 
Dozen) No Bid No Bid  $                 3.48  $               10.44 No Bid  $                 5.49 

Post-it Note Pads #653 (per 
Dozen) No Bid No Bid  $                 1.56  $                 4.44 No Bid  $                 1.71 

Accountant Worksheet Pad Two 
Column #8802 (Each) No Bid No Bid  $                 1.85  No Bid No Bid  No Bid 

Highlighter Markers All 
Colors Sanford (Each) No Bid No Bid  $                 0.99  Disc. No Bid  $                 2.04 

Paper Clips 2" Smooth Finish 
(100/Box) No Bid No Bid  $                 0.59  $                 1.35 No Bid  $                 5.99 

Paper Clips 1 3/8" Smooth 
Finish (100/Box) No Bid No Bid  $                 0.20  No Bid No Bid  No Bid 

Paper Clips 15/16" Smooth 
Finish (100/Box) No Bid No Bid  $                 0.55  No Bid No Bid  $                 5.69 

File Folder Fasteners Self 
Adhesive #2ABF (100/Box) No Bid No Bid  $                 3.15  $                 7.06 No Bid  $                 4.79 

Blank Labels Self Adhesive 
White #S-6432 (per Box) No Bid No Bid  $                 2.49  $                 3.03 No Bid  $                 2.22 

Calculator Ribbons Black & 
Red #E201 (Each) No Bid No Bid  $                 0.87  No Bid No Bid  $                 2.55 

Calculator Paper Roll 2 1/4" 
Wide (12/Pack) No Bid No Bid  $                 0.45  $                 0.54 No Bid  $                 0.68 



      

Office Depot Staples Business 
Advantage

Vendor

                    

Bid Item
       

    

Iberia Office 
Supply Office Mart Shamrock Office 

Supply, Inc.
Teche Office 
Supplies, Inc.
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41 File Folders Brown Legal 2" capacity prong "K" 
style Smead #19837 (50/Box) No Bid No Bid  $               27.09  No Bid No Bid  No Bid 

Binder Clips 1" Capacity 
(12/Box) No Bid No Bid  $                 2.19  $                 1.39 No Bid  $                 2.49 

Binder Clips 5/8" Capacity 
(12/Box) No Bid No Bid  $                 0.77  $                 0.48 No Bid  $                 0.99 

Binder Clips 3/8" Capacity 
(12/Box) No Bid No Bid  $                 0.35  $                 0.27 No Bid  $                 0.49 

Staples Swingline #SF3 Half 
Strips (5,000/Box) No Bid No Bid  $                 2.49  $                 2.77 No Bid  $                 2.92 

Rubber Bands 1/4 lb. Box 3 1/2" x 
1/32" 1/8" #33 (Per Box) No Bid No Bid  $                 0.75  $                 1.02 No Bid  $                 1.32 

Rubber Bands 1/4 lb. Box 3 1/2" x 
1/32" 1/16" #19 (Per Box) No Bid No Bid  $                 0.75  $                 1.02 No Bid  $                 1.32 

Liquid Paper Brand Correction 
Fluid Just for Copies (Each) No Bid No Bid  $                 1.05  $                 1.29 No Bid  $                 1.19 

Liquid Paper Brand Correction 
Fluid All Colors (Each) No Bid No Bid  $                 1.25  $                 1.08 No Bid  $                 1.99 

Eraser Refills Pentel #Z2-1 
(3/Tube) No Bid No Bid  $                 0.79  $                 0.98 No Bid  $                 1.01 

Lead Refills Pentel 5mm 
(12/Tube) No Bid No Bid  $                 0.49  $                 0.52 No Bid  $                 0.66 

No. 2 Pencils (12/Box) No Bid No Bid  $                 1.19  $                 2.01 No Bid  $                 0.69 

Pilot Precise V5 Pen Red, 
Blue, & Black (12/Box) No Bid No Bid  $                 1.19  $                 1.20 No Bid  $                 1.25 

Flair Felt Tip Pen Purple 
(12/Box) No Bid No Bid  $                 0.95  $                 1.18 No Bid  $                 1.04 

Pilot G2 Gel Ink Pen Extra Fine 
Black, Blue, & Red (12/Box)

Paper-Mate Sure Grip Pens Medium 
Point All Colors (12/Box) No Bid  $                 0.35  No Bid  $                 0.94 No BidNo Bid

No Bid  $                 1.09  $                 1.22  $                 1.29 No BidNo Bid



      

Office Depot Staples Business 
Advantage

Vendor

                    

Bid Item
       

    

Iberia Office 
Supply Office Mart Shamrock Office 

Supply, Inc.
Teche Office 
Supplies, Inc.
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6.

CD-R w/ Slim Jewel Case                 
(10 Pack) No Bid No Bid  $                 3.99  $                 5.28 No Bid  $                 8.19 

Letter/Legal Perma Pak Storage Box #1215 
12"W x 10 1/2"H x 15"D (Each) No Bid No Bid  $                 2.75  $                 3.73 No Bid  $               93.50 

Check Box Liberty #2 5,000 Capacity 
9"W x 3 3/4"H x 24" D (Each) No Bid No Bid  $                 5.09  $                 6.41 No Bid  $               84.44 

Data Binders 10" Nylon Posts All 
Colors #14-148 (Each) No Bid No Bid  $                 6.50  No Bid No Bid  $                 7.59 

Index Sets Insertable #489-
148M 6/Set (10 Sets/Box) No Bid No Bid  No Bid  No Bid No Bid  $                 3.56 

Group 3 Sub-Total                  
(Office Supplies) No Bid No Bid  N/A  N/A No Bid  N/A 

3. FOR INTERNAL USE ONLY
DEPARTMENT 

APPROVAL
AWARD LETTER                        

DATE
REGRET LETTER                        

DATE

AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE

START DATE END DATE

AWARDED VENDOR

Office Mart - Groups 1 & 3                                
Teche Office Supplies - Groups 2

NAMES OF IBERIA PARISH GOVERNMENT                                                               
STAFF MEMBERS IN ATTENDANCE OF BID OPENING

Kimberly Segura, Finance Director
Michael Broussard, Purchasing Officer

01/13/2009  
Kimberly Segura 1/13/2009 1/13/2009 1/15/2009 6/30/2009
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