BID NAME:

& Light Bulbs

Janitorial Supplies, Paper Products,

TOTAL # OF BIDS:

3

Basic Supply,

Bayou Electric &

300 Iberia Street « New Iberia, LA 70560-4543
(337)365-8246 * Fax (337)369-4490

BID TABULATION FORM

JEM Products

K & J Supplies,

Vendor

NOTOCO

BID OPENING DATE:

12/29/2008

BID OPENING TIME:

2:00 P.M.

Teche Electric

LLC Specialty, Inc. Inc. Industries, LLC
One Ply Toilet Tissue 96/Case Late Bid No Bid No Bid $ 66.12 No Bid No Bid
Single Fold Paper Towels 4000/Case Late Bid No Bid No Bid $ 25.81 No Bid No Bid
Multi-Fold Paper Towels 4000/Case Late Bid No Bid No Bid $ 20.67 No Bid No Bid
One Ply Roll Hand Towels 8" x 350/Roll Late Bid No Bid No Bid $ 12.00 No Bid No Bid
ey Late Bid No Bid No Bid $ 124.60 No Bid No Bid
100W Regular Bulb Late Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0.35| $ 0.22
60W Regular Bulb Late Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0.35| $ 0.22
150W Regular Bulb Late Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 091 $ 0.43
4' White Fluorescent 40W Late Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1.101 $ 0.97
8' White Fluorescent 40W Late Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 2991 % 2.15
12" Circle White Fluorescent 32W Late Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 2801 $ 2.21
40W Ballast 2 Bulb Rapid Start 4' Fluorescent Late Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 9.50| $ 12.58
75W Ballast 2 Bulb Rapid Start 8 Fluorescent Late Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 17.50] $ 20.19
100W 120V Frosted Safe Line Bulb Late Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1.20| $ 3.30
4' 34W White Fluorescent Late Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1.101 $ 0.97
PR Late Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 37.80|'$ 43.24
Crawling Bulb Aerosol Cans Late Bid No Bid No Bid $ 54.72 No Bid No Bid
Trash Bags 23x17x46 .71 thick min. Late Bid No Bid No Bid $ 12.41 No Bid No Bid




. Basic Supply, Bayou Electric & K & J Supplies, NOTOCO .
Bid Item LLC Specialty, Inc. i) el Inc. Industries, LLC UEEDE EIRETE
Trash Bags 15x9x24 1.0 thick min. Late Bid No Bid No Bid $ 8.95 No Bid No Bid
Color 100% Cotton T-Shirt Rags 25# Box Late Bid No Bid No Bid $ 12.00 No Bid No Bid
AN Late Bid No Bid No Bid $ 88.08 No Bid No Bid

NAMES OF IBERIA PARISH GOVERNMENT
STAFF MEMBERS IN ATTENDANCE OF BID OPENING

Kimberly Segura, Finance Director

Michael Broussard, Purchasing Officer

olalR|wNIE

AWARDED VENDOR

K & J Supplies - Group 1 (Paper Products) & Group 3
(Miscellaneous)
Teche Electric - Group 2 (Light Bulbs)

AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE

Mol B punth?——

FOR INTERNAL USE ONLY
DEPARTMENT AWARD LETTER REGRET LETTER
APPROVAL DATE DATE START DATE END DATE
1/12/2009 1/12/2009 1/15/2009 6/30/2009
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